Bids Opened Thursday May 23, 2024 @ 1:00 p.m.

Iltem 1

2024-2025

Iltem 2

Item 3

Supplemental

Sodium Hypochlorite * Sodium Hydroxide 25% * Carbon Bid Notes FY 2023 Pricing
Firm ($/Wet Pound) ($/Wet Pound) ($/Gallons) Bond
<or=.10 mg/l <or=.01mg/l <or=.10mg/l | <or=.01mgll

Borden & Remington Corp. $0.1893 $0.1893 $0.1042 $0.1042 No Bid Yes
EOSI No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.98 Check
JCI Jones Chemicals Inc. $0.1789 $0.1789 $0.1465 $0.1465 No Bid Yes
Kuene Chemical Co., Inc. $0.1870 $0.1870 $0.1375 $0.1375 No Bid Yes
Univar Solutions USA, Inc. $0.1840 $0.1840 $0.1292 $0.1292 No Bid Yes

* with mercury content less
than to 0.10 mg/l




